
             Vendor Strings Woodwinds Brass Percussion
Band Instrument Exchange No Bid 24 9 No Bid
H & H Music/Brook Mays 8 38 76 0
Hall's Family Musik, Inc. No Bid 14 30 0
Houston Stringworks 50 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lisle Violin Shop 22 No Bid No Bid No Bid
Montgomery County Music Center 11 20 3 0
The String & Horn Shop 77 45 58 5

CSP #25-024 - INSTRUMENT REPAIR (BAND/ORCHESTRA)
TABULATION

TOTAL LOW BIDS BY CATEGORY



Vendor Total Low Bids
The String & Horn Shop 77
Houston Stringworks 50
Lisle Violin Shop 22
Montgomery County Music Center 11
H & H Music/Brook Mays 8

SUMMARY - STRINGS

Evaluation for award was accomplished by totaling the number of low bids for each vendor and awarding the top three.  District personnel 
will be instructed to use low awarded bid vendor for each repair if the repair can be completed in a timely manner and in the best interest 
of the District.  If not, the next low awarded vendor will be used, etc.  Awarded vendors are highlighted.

Part A - String Repair

REPAIR: Li
sl

e 
Vi

ol
in

 S
ho

p

H
 &

 H
 M

us
ic

/
B

ro
ok

 M
ay

s

Th
e 

St
rin

g 
&

 
H

or
n 

Sh
op

M
on

tg
om

er
y 

C
ou

nt
y 

M
us

ic
 

C
en

te
r

H
ou

st
on

 
St

rin
gw

or
ks

Violin
New bridge $35.00 $36.00 $35.00 $34.00 $30.00
Recut bridge $15.00 $14.00 $12.00 $15.00 $10.00
Install new peg $13.00 $16.00 $12.00 $15.00 $8.00
Recut peg $6.00 $7.00 $6.00 $8.00 $5.00
Lubricate pegs $3.00 $4.00 $3.00 $5.00 $5.00
Bush peg holes & install pegs w/quality ebony $43.00 $46.00 $38.00 $145/set $100.00
New sound post $20.00 $19.00 $23.00 $25.00 $25.00
Reset sound post $0-10.00 $10.00 $6.00 $10.00 $5.00
New nut $25.00 $26.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
New saddle $28.00 $32.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
Reglue nut or saddle, tension pegs $6.00 $7.00 $6.00 $10.00 $10.00
Install nylon tail adjuster $6.00 $7.00 $4.00 $15.00 $8.00



REPAIR: Li
sl

e 
Vi

ol
in

 S
ho

p

H
 &

 H
 M

us
ic

/
B

ro
ok

 M
ay

s

Th
e 

St
rin

g 
&

 
H

or
n 

Sh
op

M
on

tg
om

er
y 

C
ou

nt
y 

M
us

ic
 

C
en

te
r

H
ou

st
on

 
St

rin
gw

or
ks

Reglue fingerboard $30-45.00 $30-48.00 $25.00 $30.00 $20.00
Reglue fingerboard, partial $6-20.00 $7-18.00 $10.00 $15.00 $15.00
Case repair, each latch, hinge, or bow holder $3-20.00 $7-19.00 $2-16.00 $25.00 $8.00
Replane fingerboard $40.00 $48.00 $32.00 $40.00 $25.00
Replace fingerboard $100.00 $120.00 $45.00 $110.00 $50.00
Wedge under fingerboard, reshape neck $85.00 $84.00 $60.00 $100.00 $35.00
Reset neck (additional charge for false button) $110-220.00 $120-240.00 $65.00 $100.00 $60.00
Neck graft $550-700.00 $600-780.00 $190.00 $500-650.00 $200.00
New neck $600-800.00 $660-840.00 $200.00 $500-700.00 $300.00
Play condition variable $30.00 N/A for strings $10-50.00 $20.00
OPEN INSTRUMENT REPAIRS:
Remove and replace top charges $140-220.00 $144-240.00 $70.00 $140-220.00 $100.00
Extensive cracks, per inch $4.00 $5.00 $6.00 $4.00 $15.00
Reglue opening, per bout $15-25.00 $12-24.00 $9.00 $20.00 $15.00
New endbutton, ebony $10.00 $10.00 $8.00 $20.00 $10.00
Crack repairs, from outside, minimum $30-60.00 $36-72.00 $32.00 $30.00 $15.00
New corner, no purfling $33.00 $36.00 $32.00 $50.00 $30.00
New corner, with purfling $55.00 $60.00 $45.00 $75.00 $50.00
Overhaul variable No Bid N/A for strings variable $100.00

Viola
New bridge $40.00 $42.00 $35.00 $35.00 $30.00
Recut bridge $17.00 $18.00 $12.00 $15.00 $10.00
Install new peg $14.00 $17.00 $14.00 $14.00 $8.00
Recut peg $6.00 $7.00 $6.00 $8.00 $5.00
Lubricate pegs $3.00 $4.00 $3.00 $5.00 $5.00
Bush peg holes & install pegs w/quality ebony $43.00 $48.00 $40.00 $150/set $100.00
New sound post $20.00 $19.00 $20.00 $25.00 $25.00
Reset sound post $0-10.00 $10.00 $7.00 $10.00 $5.00
New nut $25.00 $26.00 $25.00 $25.00 $25.00
New saddle $28.00 $32.00 $26.00 $30.00 $25.00
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Reglue nut or saddle, tension pegs $6.00 $7.00 $6.00 $10.00 $10.00
Install nylon tail adjuster $6.00 $7.00 $5.00 $15.00 $8.00
Reglue fingerboard $30-45.00 $36-60.00 $29.00 $30.00 $20.00
Reglue fingerboard, partial $6-20.00 $7-18.00 $10.00 $15.00 $15.00
Case repair, each latch, hinge, or bow holder $3-20.00 $7-19.00 $2-16.00 $25.00 $8.00
Replane fingerboard $40.00 $60.00 $39.00 $40.00 $25.00
Replace fingerboard $100.00 $150.00 $53.00 $110.00 $60.00
Wedge under fingerboard, reshape neck $85.00 $90.00 $69.00 $100.00 $40.00
Reset neck (additional charge for false button) $110-220.00 $120-240.00 $70.00 $100.00 $65.00
Neck graft, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $550-700.00 $600-840.00 $190.00 $500-650.00 $200.00
New neck, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $600-800.00 $660-1,080.00 $215.00 $500-700.00 $350.00
Play condition variable $30.00 N/A for strings $10-50.00 $25.00
OPEN INSTRUMENT REPAIRS:
Remove and replace top charges $140-220.00 $168-300.00 $70.00 $120.00 $100.00
Extensive cracks, per inch $4.00 $5.00 $6.00 $4.00 $15.00
Reglue opening, per bout $15-25.00 $12-24.00 $7.00 $20.00 $15.00
New endbutton, ebony $10.00 $10.00 $7.00 $20.00 $10.00
Crack repairs, from outside, minimum $30-60.00 $36-72.00 $32.00 $30.00 $15.00
New corner, no purfling $33.00 $36.00 $32.00 $50.00 $30.00
New corner, with purfling $55.00 $60.00 $43.00 $75.00 $50.00
Overhaul variable No Bid N/A for strings variable $100.00

Cello
New bridge $80.00 $84.00 $70.00 $70.00 $70.00
Recut bridge $25.00 $26.00 $18.00 $25.00 $20.00
Install new peg $28.00 $31.00 $24.00 $29.00 $20.00
Recut peg $10.00 $12.00 $10.00 $10.00 $10.00
Lubricate pegs $6.00 $7.00 $3.00 $10.00 $5.00
Bush peg holes & install pegs w/quality ebony $60.00 $72.00 $58.00 $200/set $200.00
Cello cover, resew most problems $10-30.00 No Bid $5-20.00 No Bid N/A
New sound post $30.00 $36.00 $30.00 $30.00 $30.00
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Reset sound post $0-15.00 $14.00 $10.00 $15.00 $40.00
New nut $40.00 $36.00 $39.00 $39.00 $40.00
New saddle $40.00 $36.00 $39.00 $39.00 $40.00
Reglue nut or saddle, tension pegs $10.00 $12.00 $8.00 $10.00 $15.00
Install nylon tail adjuster $14.00 $17.00 $9.00 $16.00 $15.00
Reglue fingerboard $50-75.00 $60-72.00 $45.00 $60.00 $40.00
Reglue fingerboard, partial $15-30.00 $18-36.00 $15.00 $20.00 $25.00
Replane fingerboard, includes new nut if necessary $75-115.00 $90.00 $70.00 $110.00 $85.00
Replace fingerboard $230.00 $276.00 $170.00 $250.00 $250.00
Wedge under fingerboard, reshape neck $120.00 $120.00 $89.00 $125.00 $150.00
Reset neck (additional charge for false button) $150-250.00 $150-240.00 $95.00 $150.00 $150.00
Neck graft, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $750-1,300.00 $840-1,560 $295.00 $700-1,200.00 $350.00
New neck, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $800-1,350.00 $840-1,560.00 $360.00 $800-1,300.00 $500.00
Play condition variable $40.00 N/A for strings $20-75.00 $45.00
OPEN INSTRUMENT REPAIRS:
Remove and replace top charges $200-300.00 $216-360.00 $80.00 $180.00 $150.00
Reglue opening, per bout $15-30.00 $12-24.00 $17.00 $25.00 $20.00
New endpin, ebony socket with long rod (Boxwood, ULSA) $40-80.00 $67-90.00 $40-79.00 $75.00 $100.00
Crack repairs, from outside, minimum $30-60.00 $36-72.00 $30-45.00 $30.00 $25.00
New corner, no purfling $33.00 $36.00 $39.00 $50.00 $40.00
New corner, with purfling $55.00 $60.00 $48.00 $75.00 $65.00
Overhaul variable No Bid N/A for strings variable $150.00

Double Bass
New bridge $140.00 $156.00 $130.00 $145.00 $150.00

With Adjusters $175.00 $192.00 $160.00 $180.00 $200.00
Recut bridge $30-60.00 $30-60.00 $24.50 $45.00 $40.00
Remove and replace machine heads $50.00 $174.00 $140-190.00 $200/set $450.00
New soundpost $40.00 $42.00 $39.00 $40.00 $60.00
Reset sound post $0-15.00 $14.00 $11.00 $15.00 $17.50
New nut $50.00 $48.00 $44.00 $46.00 $50.00
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New saddle $50.00 $48.00 $44.00 $46.00 $50.00
Reglue nut or saddle $12.00 $14.00 $8.00 $12.00 $15.00
Install brass tail adjuster $35.00 $36.00 $20.00 $40.00 $25.00
Reglue fingerboard $70-100.00 $72-96.00 $59.00 $85.00 $50.00
Reglue fingerboard, partial $25-50.00 $24-60.00 $20-40.00 $25.00 $30.00
Replane fingerboard, includes new nut if necessary $100-150.00 $120.00 $45-90.00 $100.00 $150.00
Replace fingerboard $420.00 $480.00 $260.00 $450.00 $500.00
Wedge under fingerboard, reshape neck $175.00 $180.00 $130.00 $180.00 $200.00
Reset neck (additional charge for false button) $220-300.00 $240-360.00 $180.00 $250.00 $350.00
Neck graft, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $900-1,300.00 $840-1,560.00 $610.00 $900-1,200.00 $1,200.00
New neck, including install pegs, not including fingerboard $1,200-1,700.00 $1,320-2,040.00 $890.00 $1,200-1,700.00 $2,000.00
Play condition variable $50.00 N/A for strings $25-80.00 $65.00
OPEN INSTRUMENT REPAIRS:
Remove and replace top charges $275-440.00 $300-480.00 $210.00 $275.00 $200.00
Reglue opening, per bout $20-30.00 $30-48.00 $25.00 $30.00 $30.00
New endpin, ebony socket with long rod (ULSA) $90.00 $102.00 $60-80.00 $110.00 $125.00
Rebush endpin $40.00 $48.00 $39.00 $40.00 $75.00
Crack repairs, from outside, minimum $30-60.00 $36-72.00 $30-45.00 $30.00 $30.00
New corner, no purfling $40.00 $36.00 $41.00 $60.00 $50.00
New corner, with purfling $60.00 $60.00 $52.00 $80.00 $65.00
Overhaul variable No Bid N/A for strings on inspection $150.00

Bow
Rehair, violin, viola (Wood/Glasser) $30.00 $35.00 / $33.00 $30.00 / $25.00 $30.00 $25.00
Rehair, cello (Wood/Glasser) $35.00 $40.00 / $38.00 $35.00 / $26.00 $35.00 $25.00
Rehair, bass (Wood/Glasser) $35.00 $40.00 / $38.00 $39.00 / $28.00 $35.00 $25.00
Retie at tip $10.00 $12.00 $7.00 $10.00 $10.00
Retie at frog $12.00 $10.00 $6.00 $10.00 $10.00
New ferrule wedge $10.00 $14.00 $10.00 $10.00 $8.00
New screw and eyelet, nickel, violin, viola, cello $20.00 $24.00 $8.00 $10.00 $15.00
New screw and eyelet, Glasser for bass $10.00 $12.00 $9.00 $25.00 $3.75
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New eyelet $10.00 $10.00 $4.00 $15.00 $1.50
New screw and eyelet, nickel, bass $26.00 $30.00 $17.00 $10.00 $22.50
New grip leather and winding $30.00 $29.00 $42.00 $30.00 $40.00
New thumbgrip – leather $10.00 $6.00 $5-30.00 $33.00 $10.00
New bone tip – violin, viola $30.00 $29.00 $24.00 $25.00 $25.00
New bone tip – cello $30.00 $29.00 $24.00 $35.00 $40.00
New bone tip – bass $30.00 $33.60 $32.00 $40.00 $60.00
New slide, violin, viola, cello $30.00 $24.00 $14.00 $40.00 $15.00
New slide, bass $30.00 $30.00 $20.00 $35.00 $25.00
Repair broken tip $40-100.00 $42-120.00 $34.00 $35.00 $75.00
Repair cracks in stick $25-75.00 $24-90.00 $20.00 $40-100.00 $25.00
New Glasser frog with rehair for violin, viola $10-25.00 $30.00 $25.00 $25-60.00 $30.00
New Glasser frog with rehair, cello $10-25.00 $32.00 $26.00 $39.00 $30.00
New Glasser frog with rehair, bass $10-25.00 $36.00 $28.00 $47.00 $30.00
New wooden frogs, each varies on type $30-250.00 $21-40.00 $51.00 $45.00
Recamber student bows $20.00 $50.00 $10-20.00 $50-65.00 $30.00
Play condition varies No Bid N/A for strings $10-45.00 $25.00



Vendor Total Low Bids
The String & Horn Shop 45
H & H Music/Brook Mays 38
Band Instrument Exchange 24
Montgomery County Music Center 20
Hall's Family Musik, Inc. 14

Part B - Woodwind Instrument Repair

SUMMARY - WOODWINDS

Evaluation for award was accomplished by totaling the number of low bids for each vendor and awarding the top three.  District personnel will be 
instructed to use low awarded bid vendor for each repair if the repair can be completed in a timely manner and in the best interest of the District.  
If not, the next low awarded vendor will be used, etc.  Awarded vendors are highlighted.
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Piccolo
Complete repad all keys $180.00 $70-120.00 $219.00 $180.00 $169.00
Replace spring $15.00 $5-7.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $5.00 $8.00 $15.00 $9.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $8-12.00 $20.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $10.00+ $15.00 $10.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $5.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $8.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $55.00 $15.00 $54.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $55.00 $35.00 $54.00+ $10-60.00 $39.00
Overhaul $260.00 $150.00 $375.00 $200.00 $219.00
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Flute
Complete repad all keys $180-200.00 $70-150.00 $179-209.00 $180.00 $199.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $6.00 $8.00 $15.00 $9.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 N/A $15.00 N/A N/A
Recork mouthpiece N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $10.00+ $15.00 $10.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $55-60.00 $15.00 $44-49.00 $35.00 $19.00
Play condition $55-60.00 $40.00 $44+-49.00+ $10-65.00 $39.00
Overhaul $295.00 $250.00 $390.00 $200.00 $249.00
English Horn
Complete repad all keys $275.00 $200-360.00 $325-475.00 N/A $349.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 N/A $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-15.00 $6.00 $8.00 N/A $9.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $8-12.00 $25.00 N/A $12.00
Recork mouthpiece N/A N/A N/A N/A $19.00
Remove accessible dent N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ N/A $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ N/A $9.00
Align keys $60.00 $15.00 $59.00 N/A $19.00
Play condition $60.00 $50.00 $59.00+ N/A $39.00
Overhaul $470.00 $460.00 $840.00 N/A $425.00

Clarinet
Complete repad all keys $200.00 $150-225.00 $179-209.00 $145.00 $199.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $6.00 $8.00 $15.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $8-12.00 $15-25.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 $8.00 $15.00 $11.00 $12.00
Remove accessible dent N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $55.00 $15.00 $44.00 $25.00 $19.00
Play condition $55.00 $45.00 $44.00+ $10-60.00 $39.00
Overhaul $260.00 $275.00 $375.00 $165.00 $269.00

Alto Clarinet
Complete repad all keys $240.00 $150-225.00 $249.00 $220.00 $199.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $6.00 $8.00 $20.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $8-12.00 $30.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 $8.00 $25.00 $11.00 $12.00
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 N/A $20.00+ $15.00 bell $10.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $60.00 $15.00 $49.00 $30.00 $19.00
Play condition $60.00 $45.00 $49.00+ $10-70.00 $39.00
Overhaul $300.00 $275.00 $575.00 $240.00 $269.00
Bass Clarinet
Complete repad all keys $280.00 $200-310.00 $389.00 $250.00 $199.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $6.00 $8.00 $20.00 $14.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $8-12.00 $30.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 $10.00 $25.00 $11.00 $12.00
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 N/A $20.00+ $15.00 bell $10.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $60.00 $15.00 $54.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $60.00 $45.00 $54.00+ $10-80.00 $49.00
Overhaul $495.00 $395.00 $685.00 $270.00 $299.00
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Oboe
Complete repad all keys $225-275.00 $240.00 $250-475.00 $250.00 $470.00
Replace spring $15.00 $6.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $6.00 $8.00 $12.00 $15.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 $20-25.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Remove accessible dent N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $55-60.00 $15.00 $49-59.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $55-60.00 $50.00 $49+-59.00+ $10-60.00 $39.00
Overhaul $400-470.00 $375.00 $850.00 on inspection $455.00

Bassoon
Complete repad all keys $350.00 $425.00 $325-475.00 $265.00 $440.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $1-6.00 $9.00 $8.00 $14.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 $30.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece N/A N/A (bocal) $30.00 N/A $19.00
Remove accessible dent N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $60.00 $15.00 $59.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $60.00 $60.00 $59.00+ $10-60.00 $39.00
Overhaul $450.00 $535.00 $1,200.00 on inspection $510.00
Soprano Sax
Complete repad all keys $375.00 $235.00 $450.00 $300.00 $299.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $9.00 $8.00 $13.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 Neck $30.00 Neck $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 N/A N/A $11.00 N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $20.00+ $15.00 $12.00
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Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $55.00 $15.00 $59.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $55.00 $35.00 $59.00+ $10-70.00 $39.00
Overhaul $650.00 $300-750.00 $1,200.00 on inspection $625.00

Alto Sax
Complete repad all keys $425.00 $300.00 $399.00 $300.00 $299.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $9.00 $8.00 $13.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 Neck $30.00 Neck $11.50 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 N/A N/A $11.00 N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $20.00+ $20.00 $12.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $10.00 $9.00
Align keys $60.00 $15.00 $49.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $60.00 $40.00 $49.00+ $10-75.00 $39.00
Overhaul $660.00 $490-750.00 $1,320.00 on inspection $625.00

Tenor Sax
Complete repad all keys $475.00 $340.00 $450.00 $340.00 $349.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $9.00 $8.00 $14.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 Neck $30.00 Neck $11.50 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 N/A N/A $11.00 N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $25.00+ $20.00 $12.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $15.00 $9.00
Align keys $65.00 $15.00 $54.00 $40.00 $19.00
Play condition $65.00 $45.00 $54.00+ $15-85.00 $49.00
Overhaul $695.00 $550-950.00 $1,450.00 on inspection $675.00
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Baritone Sax
Complete repad all keys $550.00 $495.00 $600.00 $460.00 $499.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $9.00 $8.00 $15.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 Neck $30.00 Neck $11.50 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 N/A N/A $11.00 N/A
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $25.00+ $20.00 $19.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $15.00 $9.00
Align keys $75.00 $15.00 $69.00 $50.00 $19.00
Play condition $75.00 $45.00 $69.00+ $15-100.00 $59.00
Overhaul $1,195.00 $1,400-2,000.00 $2,295.00 on inspection $1,175.00

Cont. Cl.
Complete repad all keys $400.00 $400.00 $650.00 $275.00 $249.00
Replace spring $15.00 $9.00 $20-35.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace and seat one pad $2-10.00 $9.00 $8.00 $13.00 $12.00
Recork tenon joints $15.00 $10.00 $30.00 $11.00 $12.00
Recork mouthpiece $15.00 $12.00 $30.00 $11.00 $12.00
Remove accessible dent $0-10.00 $10.00 $20.00+ Bell $20.00 $19.00
Replace key cork and level key $0.00 $6.00 $2.00+ $10.00 $12.00
Straighten bent key $0-15.00 $9.00 $6.00+ $15.00 $9.00
Align keys $65.00 $15.00 $64.00 $50.00 $19.00
Play condition $65.00 $70.00 $64.00+ $15-85.00 $59.00
Overhaul $700.00 $700-1,600.00 $875.00 on inspection $875.00



Vendor Total Low Bids
H & H Music/Brook Mays 76
The String & Horn Shop 58
Hall's Family Musik, Inc. 30
Band Instrument Exchange 9
Montgomery County Music Center 3

Part C - Brass Instrument Repair

SUMMARY - BRASS

Evaluation for award was accomplished by totaling the number of low bids for each vendor and awarding the top three.  District personnel will be 
instructed to use low awarded bid vendor for each repair if the repair can be completed in a timely manner and in the best interest of the District.  
If not, the next low awarded vendor will be used, etc.  Awarded vendors are highlighted.
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Trumpet
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $5.00 $16-125.00 $30.00 $20.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $50.00 $20.00 $55-65.00 $45.00 $39.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
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Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play condition $25.00 $30.00 $25.00 $10-50.00 $20.00
Overhaul $365.00 $210-495.00 $650.00 on inspection $340.00

French Horn
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 N/A
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $5.00 $30-150.00 $40.00 $30.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $85.00 $40.00 $70-110.00 $85.00 $79.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $20.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.00 $2.00 $2-10.00 $20.00 $10.00
Restring valve on French Horn $5.00 $5.00 $5.00 $6.00 $5.00
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play Condition $40.00 $40.00 $20-55.00 $10-50.00 $40.00
Overhaul $865.00 $560-1,200.00 $1,600.00 on inspection $1,290.00

Marching French Horn
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $5.00 $20-100.00 $30.00 $30.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $60.00 $40.00 $55-65.00 $50.00 $49.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
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Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play Condition $25.00 $40.00 $25.00 $10-50.00 $25.00
Overhaul $575.00 $395-595.00 $1,080.00 on inspection $850.00

Baritone
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $15-65.00 $5.00 $30-150.00 $30.00 $40.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $70.00 $45.00 $60-100.00 $70.00 $54.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play Condition $25.00 $45.00 $25-35.00 $10-50.00 $28.00
Overhaul $910.00 $650-900.00 $1,800.00 on inspection $1,375.00

Marching Baritone
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $6.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $5.00 $20-100.00 $30.00 $40.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $60.00 $45.00 $55-65.00 $60.00 $54.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
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Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play Condition $25.00 $45.00 $25.00 $10-50.00 $28.00
Overhaul $605.00 $450-750.00 $1,315.00 on inspection $850.00

Tenor Trombone
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 N/A $2.00 $5.50 N/A
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $5.00 $16-125.00 $30.00 $30.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $5.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $50.00 $20.00 $45-65.00 $45.00 $39.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $10.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $3.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 N/A N/A $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 N/A $2-10.00 $12.00 $10.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) $60.00 $25.00 $65-85.00 $50.00 $30.00
Play Condition $25.00 $20.00 $25.00 $10-50.00 $20.00
Overhaul $425.00 $220-700.00 $900.00 on inspection $355.00

Tuba
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $20-85.00 $10.00 $45-250.00 $45.00 $50.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 $15.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $105-130.00 $30.00 $140-175.00 $90.00 $99+
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Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $5.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $4.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $15.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play condition $35.00 $35.00 $45-60.00 $10-60.00 $50.00
Overhaul $2,000-2,200.00 $1,400-2,500.00 $4,080.00 on inspection $3,400.00

Sousa-phone
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $20-120.00 $10.00 $45-250.00 $45.00 $50.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 $15.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $110.00 $30.00 $150-175.00 $85.00 $99.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $5.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $4.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $10.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $15.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play condition $35.00 $35.00 $40-45.00 $10-60.00 $50.00
Overhaul $1,600.00 $1,400-2,500.00 $3,120.00 on inspection $2,525.00

Euphonium
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $20-80.00 $10.00 $30-150.00 $45.00 $40.00
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Resolder brace $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 $15.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $80.00 $20.00 $100.00 $60.00 $69.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $5.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $4.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $15.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play condition $30.00 $30.00 $35.00 $10-60.00 $35.00
Overhaul $910.00 $500-1,100.00 $1,800.00 on inspection $1,375.00

Cornet
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
Replace valve stem felt $0.30 $2.00 $2.00 $5.50 $5.00
Remove accessible dents $15-55.00 $10.00 $16-125.00 $30.00 $20.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $50.00 $20.00 $55-65.00 $45.00 $39.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $5.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $4.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 $5.00 $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $5.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) No Bid N/A N/A N/A N/A
Play condition $25.00 $20.00 $25.00 $10-50.00 $20.00
Overhaul $365.00 $210-550.00 $650.00 on inspection $340.00

Bass Trombone
Replace spit valve cork $0.30 $1.00 $0.00 $6.00 $5.00
Replace spit valve spring $0.75 $2.00 $15.00 $15.00 $5.00
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Replace valve stem felt $0.30 N/A $2.00 $5.50 N/A
Remove accessible dents $20-60.00 $10.00 $20-130.00 $30.00 $30.00
Resolder brace $15.00 $10.00 $10.00 $12.00 $15.00
Chemical clean and flush $70.00 $20.00 $80-85.00 $55.00 $49.00
Pull stuck slide $0-15.00 $4.00 $15.00+ $10.00 $5.00
Pull stuck mouthpiece $0.00 $3.00 $0.00 $5.00 $5.00
Straighten bent water key $0.00 $4.00 $6.00+ $5.00 $5.00
Straighten valve stem $0.00 $6.00 N/A $10.00 $5.00
Replace valve  spring $0.75 $2.00 $2-10.00 $12.00 $10.00
Restring valve on French Horn N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
Realign slide on trombone (Slide Job) No Bid $25.00 $45-65.00 $50.00 $30.00
Play condition $35.00 $25.00 $45.00 $10-50.00 $25.00
Overhaul $425.00 $300-595.00 $1,200.00 on inspection $725.00



Vendor Total Low Bids
The String & Horn Shop 5
H & H Music/Brook Mays 0
Hall's Family Musik, Inc. 0
Montgomery County Music Center 0

Part D - Percussion Instrument Repair

SUMMARY - PERCUSSION

Evaluation for award was accomplished by totaling the number of low bids for each vendor.  District personnel will be instructed to 
use low bid vendor for each repair if the repair can be completed in a timely manner and in the best interest of the District.  Awarded 
vendor is highlighted.
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29” timpani head replacement $195.00 $59.00 No Bid on inspection
14” snare drum batter head replacement $45.00 $16.00 $45-85.00 on inspection
Tension rods and lug casing for snare drum $20.00 $6-19.00 $40.00 on inspection
Marching snare strainer and snare butt replacement $75.00 $40-60.00 No Bid on inspection
28” bass drum rim replacement varies $90-190.00 No Bid on inspection




